
Jack Wilson 

 
….. was first recorded playing rugby league for the St Patrick’s under 18’s rugby league team in 1937.  
He was a talented fullback and goal kicker. 
 

 
Goulburn Evening Penny Post 8 July 1937 

 

It was in 1938 that he was really noticed. He played rugby league for both St Patrick’s College and 
Goulburn CYMS that year and was selected in the Goulburn representative teams that played against 
teams from the Sydney metropolitan area. 
 

 
                   Goulburn Evening Penny Post 21 June 1938                             Goulburn Evening Penny Post 22 June 1938 
 

 
Goulburn Evening Penny Post 12 June 1938 

 

In 1939 rugby union made a resurrection in the Goulburn district after not having been played for 
many years. Both Goulburn CYMS and St Patrick’s College crossed over to rugby union. There was a 
strong competition in Canberra, and Goulburn had the opportunity to form a representative team to 
play against this stronger opposition. The Country Carnival was held at Canberra that year and Jack 
Wilson, while still playing for St Patrick’s College, was selected in the Goulburn District team. 
 

  
Canberra Times 18 May 1939 



 
In June 1939, Jack captained the St Patrick’s College team to a win against a Combined NSW 
Metropolitan team. Following his good performance at the Country Carnival, he followed up with 
another fine display causing some of the respected officials to consider him as a potential 
international. 

 
Goulburn Evening Penny Post 16 June 1939 

 
While playing in a Senior Schools rugby union match for St Patrick’s College in August 1939, Jack scored 
three tries from the fullback position. This feat would not raise much attention in the modern era but 
it did create some excitement at the time with the Goulburn Evening Penny Post noting that this had 
never been achieved in a Sydney premiership game, the closest being two tries by a fullback attributed 
to Jim Sharman in 1933, who joined Wests the following year and later became Wests captain. The 
other player was L Bedford of Randwick.  
 

 
                                  Canberra Times 10 August 1939                            Goulburn Evening Penny Post 10 August 1939 
 

 
                                                                                   Canberra Times 16 August 1939 
 

Jack Wilson was selected to represent and captain ACT Secondary Schools against a visiting Christian 
Brothers College (Waverley) in September 1939. There was great interest and commentary in the 
Canberra newspapers regarding the combined schools team and the prospect of matching it with one 



of Sydney’s top rugby union schools. The Sydney side took the win but the ACT team performed well 
with none better than Jack Wilson.  
 

  
                              Canberra Times 24 August 1939                                                 Canberra Times 31 August 1939 
 

  
Canberra Times 31 August and 1 September 1939 

 

 
Canberra Times 4 September 1939 

 

St Patrick’s College took all before it in 1939, winning  the ACT Senior Secondary Schools rugby union 
competition. It was Jack Wilson’s last year at school and his success in both the schools competition 
as well as at the representative level would potentially set him up for greater honors.   

 

 
Canberra Times 16 November 1939 

 

After leaving school, Jack turned to rugby league and joined the Goulburn Railway team in 1940. He 
played at five-eighth for Goulburn Railway but reverted to fullback in the minor representative games 
played that year. Jack’s Railway team took out the Goulburn minor and major premierships in 1940.  



 
Goulburn Evening Post  23 September 1940 

 

In 1941 Jack was recognised by the Selectors and was chosen to play rugby league with the Goulburn 
District representative team. Cup football was proving a near impossibility due to the draw on players 
for the war effort. However, Goulburn found keen opponents from the nearby Army Camp, but this 
was problematic given that the soldiers were often transferred at short notice and they lacked proper 
playing gear. One newspaper report noted that the Army players were wearing sand shoes during the 
match. 
 
A highlight of the 1941 season was a match at Goulburn between a Southern Districts representative 
team and Western Suburbs from Sydney. The Southern team included Jack Wilson from Goulburn and 
Ron Williams from Queanbeyan who would play one First Grade game for Wests in 1945. This match 
provided an obvious connection between Jack and Wests, but how he ended up at Wests in 1942 is a 
little more complicated. 
 

 
                                  Goulburn Evening Post 25 July 1941                Goulburn Evening Post 13 August 1941 
 

 
Canberra Times16 August 1941 



Jack turned his hand to refereeing junior rugby league games in 1941, but in May he enlisted at 
Goulburn, NSW with the Citizens Military Forces and was accepted for service at the end of the football 
season. He was posted to the 2nd Ambulance Train. 

 

 
Wounded being transferred into waiting ambulances at Rosehill Station 

 

In June 1941 the New South Wales Government Railways converted two train sets for military use as 
hospital trains. They were handed over in February 1942 and were manned by units known as the 2nd 
and 3rd Australian Ambulance Train. The 2nd Ambulance Train generally worked on the Sydney to 
Albury main line and the Sydney to Bathurst line. Goulburn is on the main Sydney to Albury rail line so 
it is understandable as to why Jack Wilson was posted to this unit. 
 
However by October 1941 he was transferred to the Wallgrove Army Camp in Western Sydney. The 
following month he was transferred to the 113th Australian General Hospital at Concord (Concord 
Repatriation Hospital) in the heart of Wests territory. A news report in the Daily Telegraph in March 
1942 confirmed that Jack Wilson was working at the Concord Hospital. 

 

 
Daily Telegraph 13 March 1942 

 
Daily Telegraph 7 April 1942 

 



Jack trialled with Wests at the start of 1942 and made an impact, with him being referred to as the 
“find of the season.” He did not play in the first two rounds of the 1942 competition, so that his debut 
with Wests was in round 3, and what a debut it was!  
 
In round 3 of 1942, in his first appearance with Wests, Jack Wilson was selected as the fullback for the 
Third Grade team. Bill Keato pulled out of the First Grade team with injury and so Jack was plucked 
from Wests Thirds and played a full game in Reserve Grade. He came off the field and was then called 
up into the First Grade team making his debut in the top grade due to the unavailability of Brian 
Thompson. Brian Thompson had earlier replaced the injured Bill Keato. 
 
Notes from that game are recorded as follows; 
 
“Wests fielded a radically changed team, basically due to injuries, Jack Wilson was originally selected 
as Third Grade fullback, played in Reserves, and then backed up in Firsts and went well.” 

 

  
                                    Third Grade Round 3 1942                       First Grade Round 3 1942 
 

Jack apparently impressed the Selectors in his first appearance in First Grade as he was once again 
selected to replace Bill Keato who remained out injured for the round 4 clash with North Sydney. 
 

 
                                    Daily Telegraph 17 May 1942                                                         RLN 23 May 1942 

 

Jack played four more lower grade games with Wests and was selected to play fullback in Reserve 
Grade against Souths on 27 June but did not play. Jack had recently been appointed as an acting 
Special Group 3 Nursing Orderly and it is most likely that his increased responsibility at the Concord 



Repatriation Hospital took precedence over football. While Jack Wilson had great potential as a player 
with Wests, he did not see out the season playing a total of two First Grade, three Reserve Grade and 
one Third Grade game in 1942. 
 
By September of 1942, Jack Wilson had enlisted for service with the AIF (Regular Army) and by 
November  that year he had been transferred to the 2/14 Australian General Hospital at Townsville, 
Queensland. The Hospital was initially established near the Quarantine Station at Cape Pallarenda and 
was primarily comprised of tents with a 200 bed capacity. This was increased to 400 beds as during 
1943 casualties began to come in regularly from hospital ships and aircraft bringing casualties from 
New Guinea and the islands.  
 
A cyclone hit Townsville in March 1944, demolishing the Hospital and scattering stores and equipment. 
Some patients were rushed to the railway station and put on Ambulance Trains, while others were 
rushed to the American Naval Hospital. The hospital was rebuilt at Mundingburra, a suburb of 
Townville,  on the banks of the Ross River.  
 
As the allied troops were moving northward by early 1945, so followed the support services including 
medical and hospital units. In March 1945 Jack Wilson embarked for Morotai and then Balikpapan in 
Borneo with the 2/3 Casualty Clearing Station. 
 

 
Nurse Orderly (2/3 Casualty Clearing Station) changing bandages on a wounded Digger, Balikpapan, Borneo - August 1945 

Source: AWM 

 
Jack remained at Balikpapan until October 1945 when he transferred to the 20th Field Ambulance. The 
20th Field Ambulance returned to Morotai awaiting transfer to Japan as part of the British 
Commonwealth Occupation Force. They arrived at Kure, Japan in March 1946 and were 
headquartered at nearby Kaitaichi. This locality is the port facility for the city of Hiroshima which was 
destroyed by the dropping of a nuclear bomb in August 1945. 
 
Life in Japan was not all work for Jack Wilson. For recreation the serviceman played football and within 
a month of his arrival, Jack suffered a football injury. He sustained a sprained right ankle and a chip 
off the tip of the right medial malleolus (ankle bone), He spent a few days in hospital recovering. 
 



 
20th Field Ambulance (Kaitaichi, Japan) October 1946 – The two tents are used as the Hospital (Source: AWM) 

  
Jack remained in Japan until January 1947, arriving back in Sydney on 8 February. He was discharged 
from the Army on 17 February 1947.  
 
Jack returned to Goulburn but there was little opportunity for a Nurse Orderly in that town in 1947. 
He was recorded playing with Goulburn Railway in the pre-season but it was evident that he was 
unemployed. A news report in April noted that his future remained uncertain but it was likely that he 
would remain in Goulburn if a position could be found for him as a shop assistant. This was a job that 
he had prior to enlisting. 

 

 
                     Goulburn Evening Post 21 March 1947                                 Goulburn Evening Post 27 March 1947 

 
Goulburn Evening Post 8 April 1947 

 

However by this time Jack was determining his own destiny and had been graded with the Canterbury 
Bankstown Club in late March 1947. He was selected to play on the wing with the Canterbury 
Bankstown Third Grade team in the opening round of the competition.  



 
Round 1 1947 

 

Jack played in the Canterbury, Third and Reserve Grade teams throughout 1947 and was a member of 
Canterbury’s Third Grade Grand Final team that were runners up to Easts. Jack Wilson scored two tries 
for Canterbury in the 8-12 Grand Final loss. 
 

 
                            Third Grade Final 13 September 1947                                                   The Sun 13 September 1947 
 

Jack remained with Canterbury Bankstown in 1948 and played the first three rounds of the 
competition in First Grade. Test winger Edgar Newham returned fom injury in round 4 and Jack 
returned to Reserve Grade. 
 

 
Daily Mirror 7 April 1948 



 
Jack Wilson (with ball) eluding Balmain’s Bob Lulham - Daily Telegraph 8 April 1948 

 
Jack was once again a regular in Canterbury’s Third Grade team by the end of the season. The Thirds 
made the semi finals but went down to Wests 4-7. That was Jack Wilson’s last game in Sydney 
premiership rugby league. 
 

 
Jack Wilson’s First Grade debut with Canterbury - 10 April 1948               Third Grade Semi Final 4 September 1948 

 



In 1949 Jack Wilson returned to Goulburn and reconnected with the Goulburn Railway Club and was 
once again selected in the Goulburn District representative team. Although there was some 
speculation that he was going to retire at the end of the 1950 season, he played representative rugby 
league with Goulburn until 1952, and then had a final year with the Railway Club in 1953. 
 

              
                        Goulburn Evening Post 24 May 1949                                           Goulburn Evening Post 4 August 1949   

 

                  
                      Goulburn Evening Post 30 March 1950                                       Goulburn Evening Post 4 December 1950 

 

             
           Goulburn Evening Post 23 July 1951                    Canberra Times 1 October 1951 - Final Goulburn v Queanbeyan 

 

             
            Goulburn Evening Post 10 April 1952                                            Goulburn Evening Post 22 July 1952 

 

 
                                                                                Goulburn Evening Post 1 May 1953 



Jack Wilson lived in Goulburn until at least 1954 and probably well into the 1960’s. However sometime 
prior to 1973, he moved to Sydney and was living at Platt St Belmore. This would have been an area 
familiar to him when he was playing with Canterbury Bankstown. 
 
He remained in the area until at least 1978 but Jack was not travelling well by then. By that time he 
was in contact with the local Returned Servicemen’s League (RSL) as there was great concern for his 
welfare. The Senior Vice President of the Belfield RSL wrote to the Army Records Office in September 
1978 to confirm his service history, so that the RSL might assist him with some measure of relief.  
 

 
 
There is no further information as to what happened to assist Jack or whether he ever recovered from 
his difficulties. It is not known if he ever married or what happened to him beyond 1978. A search of 
death records indicates that there were a number of men by the name of John Wilson that died in 
NSW in the 1970’s and 1980’s but none give any hint of being connected to this John Wilson. 
 
These days there are support groups for former rugby league players such as Pratten Park Magpies 
and the Family of League to undertake welfare checks and support former team mates who have fallen 
on hard times. That wasn’t the case in the 1970’s. 
 
Jack Wilson was a very talented rugby league player that could have achieved higher honors in the 
game but he put those ambitions aside to serve his country in the Second World War, providing aid 
and comfort to the sick and wounded in his role as a Nursing Orderly. 
 
It has been a tragedy that for so long there has been confusion about his identity with various records 
referring to his name as either Jack or Joe Wilson. This has now been corrected. There is no known 
memorial for John “Jack” Wilson but perhaps this story will be his epitaph. 


